2015 Solid Waste Bid Tabulation

Republic Services Rumpke
Regular collection of 3 year > year 3year | Syear
weekly residential Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $14.80 $14.58
) Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 o $15.32 $15.09
Trash, Recycling and 5
vard Waste for 3 and 5 —Year#3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 ‘F: 2 $15.85 $15.62
year periods with Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 = g $16.41 $16.17 NO BID
) ) ) Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 5 = $16.98 $16.73
extension options. City o o T 570 to 5-31-2021 £° $17.58 | $17.32
provides billing and ™= - = ¢ 5021 t0 5-31-2022 = $17.92
recycling bins. Year#8 | 6-1-2022to 5-31-2023 $18.55
3 year 5 year 3 year 5 year
35 Gal. $19.90 $19.47
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 65 Gal $19.99 $19.56
96 Gal $20.45 $19.96
35 Gal. $20.60 $20.15
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 65 Gal $20.69 $20.24
96 Gal $21.17 $20.66
35 Gal. $21.32 $20.86
(Automated Year#3 | 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 65 Gal $21.41 $20.95
Collection) g 96 Gal $21.91 $21.38
Regular collection of > 35 Gal. $22.06 $21.59
weekly residential Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 3 65 Gal $22.16 $21.69
Trash, Recycling and 3 96 Gal $22.67 $22.13 NO BID
Yard Waste for 3 and 5 = 35 Gal. $22.84 $22.34
year periods with Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 % 65 Gal $22.94 $22.45
extension options. City E 96 Gal $23.47 $22.90
provides billing and = 35 Gal. $23.63 $23.12
recycling bins. Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 65 Gal $23.74 $23.23
96 Gal $24.29 $23.71
35 Gal. $23.93
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 65 Gal $24.04
96 Gal $24.54
35 Gal. $24.77
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 65 Gal $24.89
96 Gal $25.39
Per Unit Per Unit Per Ton Per Unit Per Ton
3yr 5yr 3or5yr
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $10.95 $10.75 $58.00
Year #2 6-1-2016 t0 5-31-2017 | « $11.33 $11.13 $60.03
Pay As You Throw Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 J:z o | _$11.73 $11.52 $62.13
Year #4 6-1-2018105-31-2019 | £ O | $12.14 $11.92 $64.31 NO BID
Year #5 6-1-2019 t0 5-31-2020 [ & £ | $12.57 $12.34 $66.56
Year#6 | 6-1-2020t05-31-2021 | £ © | s13.01 $12.77 | $68.89
Year #7 6120210531202 | = $13.21 $71.30
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $13.68 $73.79
3 year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $14.00 $14.00
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $14.50 $14.50
cary Ot enice o [ L8| E1 0T 0531201 e
. ear -1- 0 Oo-51- . .
non_r:i? dd;isped Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $16.00 $16.00 NOBID
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $16.50 $16.50
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $17.00
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $17.00
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $2.50 $2.40
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $2.60 $2.50
Bag Service priced for | vear #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $2.70 $2.60
Trash collection only. Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $2.80 $2.70 NO BID
Price per Bagin rolls of| Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $2.90 $2.80
10 Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $3.00 $2.90
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $3.00
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $3.10
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $0.92 $0.82
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $0.95 $0.87
Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $0.99 $0.90
. . Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $1.03 $0.94
Big Item Collection Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $1.06 $0.98 NOBID
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $1.10 $1.00
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $1.02
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $1.05
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $5.15 $4.60
Recycling Service with Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $5.25 $4.73
. . Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $5.50 $4.90
2-Bins and Single
Stream Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $5.75 $5.15 NO BID
(Contractor Provided Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $6.00 $5.40
) Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $6.25 $5.65
Bins) Year#7 | 6-1-2021to 5-31-2022 $5.80
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $6.00
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $4.85 $4.35
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $5.00 $4.48
Recycling Service with | vear #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $5.15 $4.65
2-Bins and Dual Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $5.30 $4.80 NO BID
Stream Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $5.45 $4.95
(City Provided Bins) Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $5.60 $5.10
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $5.25
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $5.40



2015 Solid Waste Bid Tabulation

Republic Services Rumpke
3 year 5 year 3 year | 5 year
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65
Year #2 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2017 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65
Year #3 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2018 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65
Year #4 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2019 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
Optional Cart Rental 96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65 No BID
Year #5 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2020 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $3.50 $2.65
Year #6 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2021 65 Gal $3.65 $2.75
96 Gal $3.90 $3.00
35 Gal. $2.65
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 65 Gal $2.75
96 Gal $3.00
35 Gal. $2.65
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 65 Gal $2.75
96 Gal $3.00
35 Gal. $65.00
CART SALES 65 Gal $75.00
96 Gal $80.00
3 year 5 year 3 year 5year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $1.55 $1.55
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $1.60 $1.60
Customer Service Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 §1‘65 21.65
. Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 1.70 1.70
Rep for FUITL Day in Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $1.75 $1.75 NO BID
the City Year #6 | 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $1.80 $1.80
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $1.85
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $1.90
3 year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $0.85 $0.85
Customer Service Rep Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $0.90 $0.90
for 1/2 Day in the City Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $0.95 $0.95
(1/2 included in base Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $1.00 $1.00 NO BID
bid. This would be for Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $1.05 $1.05
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $1.10 $1.10
full day.) Year#7 | 6-1-2021to 5-31-2022 $1.15
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $1.20
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $3.87 $3.55
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $4.01 $3.67
YARD WASTE Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $4.15 $3.80
COLLECTION IN Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $4.29 $3.94 NO BID
RESIDENTS Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $4.44 $4.07
CONTAINER Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $4.60 $4.22
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $4.36
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $4.52
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $3.87 $3.55
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $4.01 $3.67
Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $4.15 $3.80
Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $4.29 $3.94
Yard Waste Alternate Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $4.44 $4.07 NO BI D
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $4.60 $4.22
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $4.36
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $4.52
3year 5 year 3 year 5 year
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $4.35 $4.18
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $4.50 $4.33
Contractor o provide | =~ o0 oo TR
ear -1- 0 5-31- . .
Yard WathgesTags or Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $4.99 $4.80 NOBID
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $5.17 $4.96
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $5.14
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $5.32
Cost/Item | Cost/Min. | Cost/Item Cost/Min.
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 $20.00 $0.00
Year #2 6-1-2016 to 5-31-2017 $20.00 $0.00
Year #3 6-1-2017 to 5-31-2018 $20.00 $0.00
Second Large item Year #4 6-1-2018 to 5-31-2019 $20.00 $0.00 NO BID
Collection Year #5 6-1-2019 to 5-31-2020 $20.00 $0.00
Year #6 6-1-2020 to 5-31-2021 $20.00 $0.00
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 $20.00 $0.00
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 $20.00 $0.00



2015 Solid Waste Bid Tabulation

Republic Services Rumpke
3 year 96 G MSW 65 G MSW
35 Gal. $14.88
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 65 Gal $15.02
96 Gal $15.15 $17.95 $15.95
35 Gal. $15.40
Year #2 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2017 65 Gal $15.55
96 Gal $15.68 $18.49 $16.43
35 Gal. $15.94
Year #3 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2018 65 Gal $16.09
96 Gal $16.23 $19.04 $16.92
35 Gal. $16.50
Year #4 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2019 65 Gal $16.65
96 Gal $16.80 $19.61 $17.43
10 Year Alternate 35 Gal. $17.08
including carts for Year #5 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2020 65 Gal $17.24
Trash and Recycling 96 Gal $17.38 $20.20 $17.95
and YW collection. 35 Gal. 317.67
Recycling EOW. RWS Year #6 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2021 65 Gal $17.84
. . 96 Gal $17.99 CPI CPI
retains ownership of
carts and buys new 35 Gal. 217.67
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 65 Gal $17.84
automated trucks. 96 Gal $17.99 Pl Pl
Includes MSW, 35Gal. | $17.67
Recycling collected in | o, 4e | 6.1-2022 to 5-31-2023 65 Gal $17.84
carts over 4 days and 96 Gal $17.99 CPI cpPl
YW collected on 35 Gal. $17.67
Friday. Year #9 6-1-2023 to 5-31-2024 65 Gal $17.84
96 Gal $17.99
35 Gal. $17.67
Year #10 6-1-2024 to 5-31-2025 65 Gal $17.84
96 Gal $17.99
35 Gal. $17.67
Year #11 6-1-2025 to 5-31-2026 65 Gal $17.84
96 Gal $17.99
35 Gal. $17.67
Year #12 6-1-2026 to 5-31-2027 65 Gal $17.84
96 Gal $17.99
35 Gal. $17.67
Year #13 6-1-2027 to 5-31-2028 65 Gal $17.84
96 Gal $17.99
Republic Services
3 year 5 year
35 Gal. $19.19 $18.45
Year #1 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2016 65 Gal $19.50 $18.75
96 Gal $19.65 $18.89
35 Gal. $19.86 $19.10
Year #2 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2017 65 Gal $20.18 $19.41
96 Gal $20.33 $19.55
35 Gal. $20.55 $19.76
Year #3 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2018 65 Gal $20.89 $20.09
96 Gal $21.04 $20.24
35 Gal. $21.27 $20.46
Year #4 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2019 65 Gal $21.62 $20.79
Optional Cart Rental 96 Gal $21.78 $20.94
35 Gal. $22.02 $21.17
Year #5 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2020 65 Gal $22.38 $21.52
96 Gal $22.54 $21.68
35 Gal. $22.79 $21.91
Year #6 6-1-2015 to 5-31-2021 65 Gal $23.16 $22.27
96 Gal $23.33 $22.44
35 Gal. $21.91
Year #7 6-1-2021 to 5-31-2022 65 Gal $22.27
96 Gal $22.44
35 Gal. $21.91
Year #8 6-1-2022 to 5-31-2023 65 Gal $22.27
96 Gal $22.44

This Alternate was not a requirement of the City, but an Alternate Republic Service offered for EOW Carted Recycling for
the carted option bid above.




