Purchase of: Water Treatment Chemicals

CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Bid Opening Date: 12/08/15

15-WTC-W

Baltimore, MD 212;

USALCO
2601 Cannery Avg

410-354-0100

Omni Materials
13 West 2nd St
Maysville KY 4105

Chemtrade Chemicals
90 East Halsey Rd
Parisppany NJ 07054
PH: 800-441-2659

Carmeuse Lime
11 Stanwix St, 21st Floor
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
412-995-2017

Kemira Water Solutions
4321 W 6th St
Lawrence, KS 66049
800-879-6353

Mississippi Lime
3870 S. Lindberg Blvd.
St. Louis, MO 63127
800-437-5463

Thatcher Co of New York
PO BOX 27407
Salt Lake City, UT 84127

NRP Midwest
2738 Spring Water Dr
Toledo, Ohio 43617
419-367-3058

Bonded Chemicals Inc.
2645 Charter St.

Columbus, Ohio 46228-460f

Orders: 800-243-7665

Shannon Chemical
PO Box 376
Malvern, PA 19355
Fax: 610-524-6050

Univar USA Inc
4600 Dues Dr
West Chester, OH 45246
Fax: 513-874-3107

Item 7 Quantity Description Fax: 412-995-5570 Fax: 785-842-2629 Fax: 419-841-2738 Fax: 614-777-9244
1 [12,000 Ib.|Potassium Permanganate 1.925/1b 1.83/Ib 1.97/Ib
NO BID

2 (0,000 Ib.|Powdered Activated Carbon .576/Ib .626/Ib .847/Ib
3 j5dry ton|Liguid Aluminum Sulfate | 425.20/ton 524.00/dry ton 433.33/dry ton
4 113,000 Ib.|Sodium Tripolyphosphate .88/Ib .874/l1b
5 [1,700 ton|Pebble Lime 177.32/ton 137.50/ton
6 0,500 gal.|Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 % 1.06/gal 1.21/gal
7 B4,350 Ib.|Watersolve 9275, ZetalL yte .95/Ib

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer

(or equal)
8 | 900 gal.|Liguid Ammonium Hydroxide 2.00/gal 1.48/gal
9 190 ton|Liquid Carbon Dioxide

BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers C|  bid bond no bid bid bond bid bond cashiers check bid bond bid bond cashiers check bid bond cashiers check bid bond




Purchase of: Water Treatment Chemical

CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Bid Opening Date: 12/08/15 F2 Industries LLC Greer Lime Water Solutions Solenis Hexagon Technologies | Cabot Norit Americas Inc| Lhoist North America Polydyne Inc Air Products and Chemical{Marubeni Specialty Chemicals
15-WTC-W 423 C Smyrna Square Dr PO Box 1900 295 Industrial Dr | Beaver Valley Rd Suite 50 PO Box 23163 3200 University Ave 20947 White Sands Rd 1 Chemical Plant Rd 7201 Hamilton Blvd 12802 Tamps Oaks Blvd
B Smyrna, TN 37167  |[lorgantown WV 26507-19( Franklin IN 46131 Wilmington DE 19803 Louisville KY 40223 Marshall TX 75670  [Ste. Geneevieve MO 63670 P Box 279 Allentown PA 18195 Suite 300
Fax: 615-459-4836 PH: 317-736-6868 PH: 302-502-0830 PH: 502-429-8990 PH: 903-923-1035 Riceboro GA 31323 Tampa FL 33637
Item 4 Quantity Description
1 [12,000 Ib.|Potassium Permanganate 1.823/lb 2.65/lb 1.75/Ib
NO BID
2 0,000 Ib.|Powdered Activated Carb .655/Ib
3 j5dry ton|Liguid Aluminum Sulfate
4 113,000 Ib.|Sodium Tripolyphosphate 1.45/1b
5 [1,700 ton|Pebble Lime 137.60/ton 256.05/ton
6 0,500 gal.|Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %
7 B4,350 Ib.|Watersolve 9275, ZetaL yte 1.01/Ib 1.18/Ib
840C, NRP 8410 Polymer
(or equal)
8 | 900 gal.|Liguid Ammonium Hydro:
9 190 ton|Liquid Carbon Dioxide 95.00/ton
BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers C cashiers check bid bond cashiers check bid bond cashiers check bid bond not included no bid not included bid bond




	Bid tab

