
CITY OF SIDNEY  

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING PROJECT: Edgewood Street Water Main Replacement

BID TABULATION

Date: July 14, 2016

Total Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit

Ref No Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

ALTERNATE A

1 441 2.75" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2 (448) 30 CY $225.00 $6,750.00 $175.00 $5,250.00

2 442 1.25" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, 9.5mm, TYPE A, PG 70-22M (448) 30 CY $235.00 $7,050.00 $225.00 $6,750.00

2 202 PAVEMENT REMOVED, ASPHALT 980 SY $12.00 $11,760.00 $10.00 $9,800.00

3 407 TACK COAT 100 GAL $3.00 $300.00 $8.00 $800.00

4 448 ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, PG 64-22 30 CY $250.00 $7,500.00 $275.00 $8,250.00

5 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 LUMP $600.00 $600.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

6 615 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT 30 SY $125.00 $3,750.00 $115.00 $3,450.00

7 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING 125 SY $4.50 $562.50 $35.00 $4,375.00

8 801 6" WATER PIPE AND FITTINGS 50 LF $85.00 $4,250.00 $200.00 $10,000.00

9 802 6" VALVE AND APPURTENANCES 4 EA $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $3,900.00 $15,600.00

10 805 3/4" WATER SERVICE TAP, TRANSFERRED (LONG) 10 EA $400.00 $4,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00

11 805 3/4" WATER SERVICE TAP, TRANSFERRED (SHORT) 10 EA $200.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $8,000.00

12 809 FIRE HYDRANT 3 EA $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,800.00 $20,400.00

13 SPEC SEDIMENT AND EROSION CONTROL 1 LUMP $500.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

14 SPEC 6" WATER MAIN CLEANING AND CIPP REHABILITATION 2600 LF $95.00 $247,000.00 $129.00 $335,400.00

15 SPEC TEMPORARY WATER SERVICE AND SERVICE CONNECTIONS 1 LUMP $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $57,200.00 $57,200.00

16 SPEC REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT OF EXISTING 6" VALVE 4 EA $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $3,900.00 $15,600.00

$368,322.50 $518,375.00

Total Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit

Ref No Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

ALTERNATE B

1 202 CURB REMOVED 150 FT $12.00 $1,800.00 $15.00 $2,250.00 $5.00 $750.00 $5.36 $804.00

2 202 REMOVED AS PER PLAN 1 LUMP $800.00 $800.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,657.63 $1,657.63

3 202 PAVEMENT REMOVED, ASPHALT 1917 SY $12.00 $23,004.00 $8.00 $15,336.00 $5.00 $9,585.00 $1.30 $2,492.10

4 304 AGGREGATE BASE 9" IN TWO LIFTS 348 CY $60.00 $20,880.00 $30.00 $10,440.00 $35.00 $12,180.00 $43.23 $15,044.04

5 441 2.75" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2 (448) 106 CY $225.00 $23,850.00 $250.00 $26,500.00 $235.00 $24,910.00 $257.75 $27,321.50

6 442 1.25" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, 9.5mm, TYPE A, PG 70-22M (448) 69 CY $235.00 $16,215.00 $270.00 $18,630.00 $300.00 $20,700.00 $353.18 $24,369.42

7 608 4" CONCRETE SIDEWALK REMOVED AND REPLACED 400 SF $6.25 $2,500.00 $10.00 $4,000.00 $10.00 $4,000.00 $7.45 $2,980.00

8 609 CITY TYPE 1 COMBINATION CURB & GUTTER 25 FT $50.00 $1,250.00 $40.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,250.00 $48.99 $1,224.75

9 609 CITY TYPE 2 COMBINATION ROLL CURB & GUTTER 125 FT $50.00 $6,250.00 $40.00 $5,000.00 $40.00 $5,000.00 $44.81 $5,601.25

10 638 6" C909 DR-18 CL 150 PVC WATER MAIN 64 FT $55.00 $3,520.00 $100.00 $6,400.00 $35.00 $2,240.00 $225.81 $14,451.84

11 638 8" C909 DR-18 CL 150 PVC WATER MAIN 2446 FT $80.00 $195,680.00 $48.00 $117,408.00 *1 $54.00 $132,084.00 $77.79 $190,274.34

12 CITY 800-5 TRACER WIRE 2600 FT $0.35 $910.00 $0.25 $650.00 $1.00 $2,600.00 $0.22 $572.00

13 638 8" X 8" TAPPING SLEEVE 2 EA $3,100.00 $6,200.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,595.21 $3,190.42

14 638 10" X 8" TAPPING SLEEVE OR 10" X 10" TAPPING SLEEVE AND 

  10" X 8" REDUCER 1 EA $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,298.21 $2,298.21

15 638 1" WATER SERVICE BRANCH 360 LF $26.00 $9,360.00 $60.00 $21,600.00 $80.00 $28,800.00 $142.26 $51,213.60

16 638 CONCRETE PLUG ENDS OF EX. WATERMAIN TO BE ABANDONED 1 LUMP $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $2,247.40 $2,247.40

17 638 8" GATE VALVE 3 EA $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,756.60 $5,269.80

18 614 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LUMP $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,963.35 $9,963.35

19 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN 1 LUMP $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,380.40 $1,380.40

20 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, AS PER PLAN 1 LUMP $800.00 $800.00 $2,374.00 $2,374.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,965.35 $9,965.35

21 811 4" SANITARY LATERAL REPAIRS 50 LF $40.00 $2,000.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $17.63 $881.50

22 811 12" CL IV RCP STORM SEWER PIPE 10 LF $40.00 $400.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $65.00 $650.00 $69.65 $696.50

23 811 8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE FOR STORM SEWER REPAIRS 15 LF $40.00 $600.00 $70.00 $1,050.00 $60.00 $900.00 $67.84 $1,017.60

$330,519.00 $259,338.00 *2 $297,149.00 $374,917.00

*1  Total given was $110,070.00

*2  Total given was $252,000.00

TOM'S CONSTRUCTION

ST. HENRY, OH

FER-PAL CONSTRUCTION

TAYLOR, MI

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TOTAL ALTERNATE  B

ENGINEER'S

ESTIMATE

STURM CONSTRUCTION

SIDNEY, OH

MILLIGAN CONSTRUCTION

SIDNEY, OH

TOTAL ALTERNATE  A


